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THE INTERNATIONAL BESTSELLER 'Whatever else Rob Mundle may write, this is likely to be his
master work' Mike Power, The Mercury 'ROB MUNDLE IS A MASTER OF THE MARITIME
NARRATIVE' Sunday Age Just before 1pm Boxing Day 1998, many thousands of Australians gathered - on
and around Sydney Harbour, or in front of their televisions - to watch the start of an annual summer sporting
tradition: the 628 nautical mile Sydney to Hobart yacht race. It was the 54th staging of one of the world's
three classic offshore races, and the harbour was laden with excitement and colour as the 115 competing
yachts jostled their way towards the start line while the countdown was in its final seconds. The moment the
cannon boomed its signal, the fleet began the short dash towards the heads, before turning south and onto the
waters of the Tasman Sea. It was an adrenaline-charged time for all competitors, but little did they know an
unpredicted major storm cell was developing offshore and lying directly in their path. The fleet and the storm
were destined to intersect. In little more than 24 hours, the majority of yachts were being hammered by
hurricane-force winds and gigantic swells, some the height of 10 storey buildings. The Sydney to Hobart had
become a race for survival. What ensued was the largest peacetime search and rescue mission Australia has
ever known. Six sailors perished, five yachts sank, 55 sailors were winched to safety. Only 44 yachts reached
the finish.
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From reader reviews:

Karen Lawless:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always try and and must have the time or they will get lots of stress
from both daily life and work. So , when we ask do people have time, we will say absolutely of course.
People is human not a robot. Then we consult again, what kind of activity do you possess when the spare
time coming to anyone of course your answer will unlimited right. Then do you ever try this one, reading
textbooks. It can be your alternative in spending your spare time, often the book you have read will be Fatal
Storm.

Jim Martin:

Fatal Storm can be one of your beginning books that are good idea. We recommend that straight away
because this guide has good vocabulary that will increase your knowledge in language, easy to understand,
bit entertaining but nevertheless delivering the information. The article writer giving his/her effort to get
every word into enjoyment arrangement in writing Fatal Storm however doesn't forget the main position,
giving the reader the hottest as well as based confirm resource details that maybe you can be among it. This
great information can certainly drawn you into new stage of crucial contemplating.

Hannah Norton:

This Fatal Storm is great guide for you because the content that is full of information for you who have
always deal with world and possess to make decision every minute. This book reveal it details accurately
using great arrange word or we can point out no rambling sentences inside. So if you are read that hurriedly
you can have whole details in it. Doesn't mean it only offers you straight forward sentences but difficult core
information with wonderful delivering sentences. Having Fatal Storm in your hand like finding the world in
your arm, information in it is not ridiculous one particular. We can say that no guide that offer you world in
ten or fifteen moment right but this e-book already do that. So , this really is good reading book. Hi Mr. and
Mrs. occupied do you still doubt that?

Vincent Newton:

Within this era which is the greater individual or who has ability to do something more are more precious
than other. Do you want to become one of it? It is just simple strategy to have that. What you must do is just
spending your time very little but quite enough to possess a look at some books. One of the books in the top
listing in your reading list is Fatal Storm. This book which can be qualified as The Hungry Hillsides can get
you closer in becoming precious person. By looking upward and review this guide you can get many
advantages.
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