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In 1925-26, the late Max Born gave two sets of lectures at M.I.T., one on the structure of the atom, the other
on the lattice theory of rigid bodies. Problems of Atomic Dynamics contains the text of both sets.What gives
this volume its remarkable interest is just those dates: 1925-26. This must have been, by all accounts, the
headiest period in twentieth-century physics, and Max Born was one of the leaders of the ferment. As
Norbert Wiener remembers, "When Professor Born came to the United States [for these lectures in 1925] he
was enormously excited about the new basis Heisenberg had just given for the quantum theory of the
atom."These lectures represent perhaps the most vivid written record of the transition between the "old"
quantum theory of Bohr, and the "new" theory. "At the time I began this course of lectures," Born writes,
"Heisenberg's first paper on the new quantum theory had just appeared. Here his masterly treatment gave the
quantum theory an entirely new turn. The paper of Jordan and myself, in which we recognized the matrix
calculus as the proper formulation of Heisenberg's ideas, was in press, and the manuscript of a third paper by
the three of us was almost completed."Even as the lecture series progressed, Born became familiar with new
results, which he introduced into his presentation: Pauli's fourth quantum number, Dirac's formalism, his
own work on a general operational calculus. And yet, in spite of the conditions of revolutionary changes in
physics that year -- in which established ancien regime principles were collapsing almost monthly -- the
theory is developed with a cool elegance and with a formal completeness which may be regarded as a
"limiting case" of its current state. These lectures represent the foundations of quantum theory, and they have
withstood the tests of time -- the tests of more than forty years of experimental evidence.
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From reader reviews:

Roger Dupre:

Spent a free time for you to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their free time with their family, or
their particular friends. Usually they undertaking activity like watching television, going to beach, or picnic
from the park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Do you wish to something different to
fill your free time/ holiday? Might be reading a book is usually option to fill your free of charge time/
holiday. The first thing that you will ask may be what kinds of publication that you should read. If you want
to try look for book, may be the book untitled Problems of Atomic Dynamics (MIT Press) can be good book
to read. May be it may be best activity to you.

David Wolverton:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 as well as 15 minute in your moment to upgrading your mind
ability or thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you are experiencing problem with the book when
compared with can satisfy your small amount of time to read it because all of this time you only find reserve
that need more time to be learn. Problems of Atomic Dynamics (MIT Press) can be your answer as it can be
read by a person who have those short extra time problems.

Robert Wilkerson:

Don't be worry if you are afraid that this book may filled the space in your house, you might have it in e-
book means, more simple and reachable. This kind of Problems of Atomic Dynamics (MIT Press) can give
you a lot of friends because by you considering this one book you have point that they don't and make you
more like an interesting person. This particular book can be one of one step for you to get success. This e-
book offer you information that maybe your friend doesn't learn, by knowing more than other make you to
be great men and women. So , why hesitate? Let us have Problems of Atomic Dynamics (MIT Press).

Bertha Morrison:

As a student exactly feel bored to be able to reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the library as
well as to make summary for some guide, they are complained. Just small students that has reading's spirit or
real their hobby. They just do what the trainer want, like asked to the library. They go to at this time there but
nothing reading really. Any students feel that looking at is not important, boring as well as can't see colorful
images on there. Yeah, it is to be complicated. Book is very important for you. As we know that on this
period, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says, many ways to reach Chinese's
country. So , this Problems of Atomic Dynamics (MIT Press) can make you feel more interested to read.
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