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With trademark insight and clarity, author Jeffrey A. Helewitz presents a vivid picture of the role of the
paralegal in complex real estate transactions. Always timely and accessible, the Fifth Edition of Basic Real
Estate and Property Law for Paralegals puts a firm grasp of both theory and practice well within a student s
reach.

A thorough yet manageable introduction to Real Estate and Property Law, featuring:

Broad coverage that includes estates in land and future interests, titles, land use, conveyancing,closing●

procedures, condos, co-ops, commercial property, and landlord-tenant law
Helpful examples that illustrate the role of the paralegal in practice●

Key terms, Practical Tips, Ethical Points, and Chapter Summaries●

A final chapter on personal property that introduces students to the essential concepts of tangible and●

intangible property
Edited cases in each chapter that give students practice reading and analyzing case decisions●

Sample legal forms in each chapter that expose students to legal documents on a variety of topics●

Extensive practice and review features, such as end-of-chapter review points, exercises, activities, and●

situational analyses

Updated throughout, the Fifth Edition provides:

The latest developments on the law surrounding same-sex marriages●

New cases●

Updated forms●

Additional case analyses in every chapter●
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From reader reviews:

Johnnie Santiago:

Do you have favorite book? For those who have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important
thing for us to understand everything in the world. Each book has different aim or even goal; it means that
reserve has different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their the perfect time to read a book. They are
really reading whatever they acquire because their hobby will be reading a book. Consider the person who
don't like reading through a book? Sometime, particular person feel need book if they found difficult
problem as well as exercise. Well, probably you should have this Basic Real Estate and Property Law for
Paralegals (Aspen College).

Amos Curley:

The actual book Basic Real Estate and Property Law for Paralegals (Aspen College) will bring that you the
new experience of reading a book. The author style to clarify the idea is very unique. If you try to find new
book to study, this book very suited to you. The book Basic Real Estate and Property Law for Paralegals
(Aspen College) is much recommended to you to see. You can also get the e-book from official web site, so
you can more readily to read the book.

Jeremy Bryant:

The publication with title Basic Real Estate and Property Law for Paralegals (Aspen College) has a lot of
information that you can understand it. You can get a lot of advantage after read this book. This particular
book exist new understanding the information that exist in this book represented the condition of the world
now. That is important to yo7u to learn how the improvement of the world. This specific book will bring you
in new era of the syndication. You can read the e-book on your own smart phone, so you can read that
anywhere you want.

Richard Broderick:

People live in this new morning of lifestyle always aim to and must have the free time or they will get wide
range of stress from both lifestyle and work. So , whenever we ask do people have time, we will say
absolutely of course. People is human not just a robot. Then we request again, what kind of activity do you
have when the spare time coming to anyone of course your answer will certainly unlimited right. Then do
you ever try this one, reading books. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, often the
book you have read is Basic Real Estate and Property Law for Paralegals (Aspen College).
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