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The key to a healthy relationship is not just managing money but understanding how the other approaches
money. 

Every couple argues about money. It doesn’t matter if you’ve been married for 40 years or dating for 4
months, money touches every decision you make as a couple. And when the two of you don’t see eye-to-eye
on how much to spend or how much to save, that’s when arguments turn into ugly toxic fights that leave both
persons feeling hurt and angry. It’s why money has become the #1 cause of divorce in the U.S. Obviously,
something needs to change. The reason this crisis has not been addressed is because it has never been
identified, defined, or given a name. Scott and Bethany Palmer, aka “The Money Couple,” have identified
and defined this problem and offer concrete solutions to fix it.

With The 5 Money Personalities™ DVD-Based Study, you can get to the root of money arguments and start
really working together. You’ll discover what has an impact on your loved one’s money decisions, and
you’ll learn how to talk about money in a way that’s actually fun! You’ll figure out how to put an end to
money secrets and lies once and for all.

Features include:

12 video sessions featuring Bethany and Scott (6-16 minutes each; 2 DVDs)●

2 copies of the Guidebook, one for each spouse●

Additional Guidebooks available for purchase (9781401678333).
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From reader reviews:

Marc Gaul:

Typically the book The 5 Money Personalities DVD-Based Study will bring one to the new experience of
reading some sort of book. The author style to clarify the idea is very unique. In case you try to find new
book you just read, this book very appropriate to you. The book The 5 Money Personalities DVD-Based
Study is much recommended to you you just read. You can also get the e-book through the official web site,
so you can more readily to read the book.

Roger Dupre:

The e-book untitled The 5 Money Personalities DVD-Based Study is the publication that recommended to
you to read. You can see the quality of the publication content that will be shown to you actually. The
language that article author use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The writer was did a lot of
research when write the book, so the information that they share to your account is absolutely accurate. You
also could possibly get the e-book of The 5 Money Personalities DVD-Based Study from the publisher to
make you far more enjoy free time.

Thanh Johnson:

This The 5 Money Personalities DVD-Based Study is fresh way for you who has curiosity to look for some
information since it relief your hunger info. Getting deeper you onto it getting knowledge more you know or
you who still having tiny amount of digest in reading this The 5 Money Personalities DVD-Based Study can
be the light food to suit your needs because the information inside this book is easy to get by simply anyone.
These books produce itself in the form that is certainly reachable by anyone, yep I mean in the e-book form.
People who think that in reserve form make them feel sleepy even dizzy this guide is the answer. So there is
absolutely no in reading a e-book especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be
here for an individual. So , don't miss this! Just read this e-book type for your better life in addition to
knowledge.

Raymond Floyd:

A lot of guide has printed but it differs from the others. You can get it by world wide web on social media.
You can choose the most beneficial book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever by searching from it.
It is named of book The 5 Money Personalities DVD-Based Study. You'll be able to your knowledge by it.
Without making the printed book, it could add your knowledge and make a person happier to read. It is most
significant that, you must aware about reserve. It can bring you from one spot to other place.
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