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Sell and Market Like a Pro!

In this new edition of his classic book, Rain Making, Ford Harding reveals step by step how--even if you've
never sold a product in your life--you can become a top performer in your organization. Filled with easy-to-
use strategies, checklists, tables, and guides, this book shows you how to:

Write articles for professional publications●

Make cold calls like a sales pro●

Network to build a lasting customer base●

Develop a winning sales strategy●

With this book at your fingertips, you'll get the marketing and sales skills you need to survive--and flourish--
one sale at a time!
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From reader reviews:

Kirk Qualls:

Do you have something that that suits you such as book? The book lovers usually prefer to decide on book
like comic, brief story and the biggest some may be novel. Now, why not attempting Rain Making: Attract
New Clients No Matter What Your Field that give your fun preference will be satisfied by simply reading
this book. Reading routine all over the world can be said as the method for people to know world a great deal
better then how they react in the direction of the world. It can't be stated constantly that reading practice only
for the geeky individual but for all of you who wants to always be success person. So , for all of you who
want to start reading as your good habit, you may pick Rain Making: Attract New Clients No Matter What
Your Field become your current starter.

Robert Denney:

Do you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store? Aim
to pick one book that you never know the inside because don't judge book by its protect may doesn't work
here is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not since fantastic as in the outside search
likes. Maybe you answer may be Rain Making: Attract New Clients No Matter What Your Field why
because the amazing cover that make you consider concerning the content will not disappoint you. The
inside or content is usually fantastic as the outside or perhaps cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly
make suggestions to pick up this book.

Verna Hibbard:

Within this era which is the greater individual or who has ability in doing something more are more valuable
than other. Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple method to have that. What you have
to do is just spending your time not very much but quite enough to experience a look at some books. Among
the books in the top list in your reading list is usually Rain Making: Attract New Clients No Matter What
Your Field. This book which is qualified as The Hungry Slopes can get you closer in becoming precious
person. By looking up and review this publication you can get many advantages.

Beverlee Guthrie:

A lot of people said that they feel uninterested when they reading a publication. They are directly felt that
when they get a half parts of the book. You can choose the particular book Rain Making: Attract New
Clients No Matter What Your Field to make your own reading is interesting. Your skill of reading talent is
developing when you including reading. Try to choose easy book to make you enjoy to read it and mingle
the sensation about book and reading through especially. It is to be very first opinion for you to like to wide
open a book and examine it. Beside that the reserve Rain Making: Attract New Clients No Matter What Your
Field can to be your brand-new friend when you're really feel alone and confuse with what must you're doing
of this time.
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