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‘An overview of the history of cocoa, the factors affecting its production and consumption as well as how the
trade is conducted, various risks mitigated, and by whom. …The International Cocoa Trade is a work
designed to inform all on the subject of cocoa and an essential guide for those involved in its trade.’

Dr J. Vingerhoets, Executive Director, ICCO

Cocoa is a valuable commodity, and the cocoa trade involves many different parties from growers and
exporters through dealers and factories to those trading futures and options and the banks they deal with. The
International Cocoa Trade provides an authoritative and comprehensive review of the cocoa trade at the
beginning of the twenty-first century, and the main factors that drive and affect that business.

The opening chapter of the third edition examines the history and origins of the international cocoa trade,
and its recent developments. The agronomics of cocoa production are discussed in chapter two whilst chapter
three deals with the environmental and practical factors affecting cocoa production. Chapters four, five and
six cover issues around the export and trading of physical cocoa, including the actuals market, the physical
contracts used and the futures and options markets. In chapter seven, the international consumption and
stocks of cocoa are reviewed with chapter eight discussing the issue of quality assessment of cocoa beans for
international trade. Finally, chapter nine focuses on the end product, examining the processing of cocoa
beans and the manufacture of chocolate. Updated appendices provide copies of some of the most important
documents used in the cocoa trade, including contracts, sale rules and world production statistics.

This comprehensively updated third edition of The International Cocoa Trade ensures its continued status as
the standard reference for all those involved in the production consumption and international trading of
cocoa.

Provides an authoritative and comprehensive review of the cocoa trade at the beginning of the twenty-first●

century, and the main factors that drive and affect that business
Examines the history and origins of the international cocoa trade, and its recent developments featuring a●

discussion of environmental and practical factors affecting cocoa production
Explores issues concerning the export and trading of physical cocoa, including the actuals market, the●

physical contracts used and the futures and options markets
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From reader reviews:

Alan Williams:

In this 21st millennium, people become competitive in each way. By being competitive currently, people
have do something to make them survives, being in the middle of typically the crowded place and notice by
means of surrounding. One thing that at times many people have underestimated that for a while is reading.
That's why, by reading a guide your ability to survive improve then having chance to stand than other is
high. To suit your needs who want to start reading a book, we give you this particular The International
Cocoa Trade, Third Edition book as basic and daily reading publication. Why, because this book is more
than just a book.

Ann Edwards:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray anyone, why because this The International Cocoa Trade, Third
Edition e-book written by well-known writer who really knows well how to make book that may be
understand by anyone who have read the book. Written with good manner for you, leaking every ideas and
writing skill only for eliminate your personal hunger then you still uncertainty The International Cocoa
Trade, Third Edition as good book not only by the cover but also from the content. This is one reserve that
can break don't ascertain book by its deal with, so do you still needing yet another sixth sense to pick this
particular!? Oh come on your studying sixth sense already alerted you so why you have to listening to a
different sixth sense.

Lily McDermott:

As a student exactly feel bored in order to reading. If their teacher requested them to go to the library or even
make summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's spirit or real their
interest. They just do what the instructor want, like asked to go to the library. They go to presently there but
nothing reading really. Any students feel that examining is not important, boring and can't see colorful
photographs on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important to suit your needs. As we know
that on this age, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says, many ways to reach
Chinese's country. So , this The International Cocoa Trade, Third Edition can make you experience more
interested to read.

Christopher Arnold:

What is your hobby? Have you heard which question when you got scholars? We believe that that concern
was given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every person has different hobby. And also you
know that little person including reading or as examining become their hobby. You need to know that
reading is very important and also book as to be the point. Book is important thing to include you
knowledge, except your own personal teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update with regards to
something by book. A substantial number of sorts of books that can you take to be your object. One of them
is this The International Cocoa Trade, Third Edition.
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