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In many ways, the development of twentieth-century literary criticism and theory can be seen as a prolonged
struggle against the pervading influence of nineteenth-century positivist historicism. Anglo-American New
Criticism and later French Post-structuralism and Deconstruction are the best-known instances of this
conflict. Less widely known, but no less important to contemporary literary studies, are Charles Péguy's
earlier debates with French academic
historicism in the years leading up to World War One. First examined by Antoine Compagnon in his ground-
breaking work La Troisième République des lettres in 1983, it is a period in French literary and cultural
history that remains, some thirty years later, largely untreated in English. This book thus addresses
an important, albeit relatively unexplored, moment in the development of twentieth-century literary history
and theory. By way of Péguy's foundational polemics with modernity and his role in the related 'crisis of
historicism', we gain a better understanding of the critical basis from which similar anti-positivist and anti-
historicist critiques were later enacted on both sides of the Atlantic. In situating Péguy's passions and
polemics within the larger cultural and historical
context, Glenn H. Roe invites us to reconsider and re-evaluate Péguy's place among twentieth-century
literary figures. Beyond its literary-critical aspects, The Passion of Charles Péguy provides a general view of
early twentieth-century debates related to the role of literary studies in modern society, the reform of
the French educational system, and the formation of literary history as an academic discipline in both France
and abroad.
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From reader reviews:

Beverly Brown:

This The Passion of Charles Péguy: Literature, Modernity, and the Crisis of Historicism book is simply not
ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your hands. The benefit you have by reading this book will be
information inside this publication incredible fresh, you will get facts which is getting deeper you read a lot
of information you will get. This specific The Passion of Charles Péguy: Literature, Modernity, and the
Crisis of Historicism without we comprehend teach the one who studying it become critical in contemplating
and analyzing. Don't always be worry The Passion of Charles Péguy: Literature, Modernity, and the Crisis of
Historicism can bring if you are and not make your bag space or bookshelves' turn into full because you can
have it inside your lovely laptop even mobile phone. This The Passion of Charles Péguy: Literature,
Modernity, and the Crisis of Historicism having good arrangement in word in addition to layout, so you will
not truly feel uninterested in reading.

Frank Johnson:

Typically the book The Passion of Charles Péguy: Literature, Modernity, and the Crisis of Historicism will
bring one to the new experience of reading the book. The author style to describe the idea is very unique. If
you try to find new book to learn, this book very ideal to you. The book The Passion of Charles Péguy:
Literature, Modernity, and the Crisis of Historicism is much recommended to you to read. You can also get
the e-book in the official web site, so you can quickly to read the book.

Eunice Randle:

Spent a free the perfect time to be fun activity to try and do! A lot of people spent their leisure time with their
family, or their own friends. Usually they doing activity like watching television, going to beach, or picnic
inside park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Do you need to something different to fill
your personal free time/ holiday? Can be reading a book is usually option to fill your no cost time/ holiday.
The first thing you will ask may be what kinds of book that you should read. If you want to attempt look for
book, may be the book untitled The Passion of Charles Péguy: Literature, Modernity, and the Crisis of
Historicism can be fine book to read. May be it can be best activity to you.

Katie Mueller:

Do you like reading a guide? Confuse to looking for your favorite book? Or your book seemed to be rare?
Why so many concern for the book? But any people feel that they enjoy for reading. Some people likes
looking at, not only science book but in addition novel and The Passion of Charles Péguy: Literature,
Modernity, and the Crisis of Historicism or even others sources were given understanding for you. After you
know how the truly amazing a book, you feel want to read more and more. Science book was created for
teacher or perhaps students especially. Those textbooks are helping them to increase their knowledge. In
various other case, beside science book, any other book likes The Passion of Charles Péguy: Literature,



Modernity, and the Crisis of Historicism to make your spare time more colorful. Many types of book like
this.
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