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In 1995, Hans Ulrich Obrist curated a unique exhibition at London’s Serpentine Gallery that not only gave
visitors the opportunity to look at the art on display, but to use it and even take it home. Art was offered as an
activity and as a transaction. Now the Jewish Museum, New York, is mounting a new edition of Take Me,
I’m Yours. Included are works by Christian Boltanski, Félix González-Torres, Andrea Fraser, Philippe
Parreno and Martha Rosler, among others. The exhibition invites viewers to consider the nature of the work
of art, and actively participate in its movement and dispersal. The catalogue is as participatory and
unexpected as the show it accompanies--a packet of postcards, showing work by the artists included in the
exhibition.
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From reader reviews:

Charlotte Hawley:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style on this era globalization. With reading you can get a lot of
information that may give you benefit in your life. Using book everyone in this world can easily share their
idea. Books can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire their own reader with their story or
maybe their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the textbooks. But also they write about the
knowledge about something that you need example of this. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
children, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors on earth always try to improve their
expertise in writing, they also doing some study before they write to their book. One of them is this Take Me
(I'm Yours).

Gail Brasfield:

The e-book with title Take Me (I'm Yours) posesses a lot of information that you can understand it. You can
get a lot of profit after read this book. This book exist new expertise the information that exist in this guide
represented the condition of the world now. That is important to yo7u to know how the improvement of the
world. This kind of book will bring you in new era of the syndication. You can read the e-book on the smart
phone, so you can read the item anywhere you want.

Helen Williams:

This Take Me (I'm Yours) is great guide for you because the content that is certainly full of information for
you who always deal with world and have to make decision every minute. This particular book reveal it
information accurately using great manage word or we can declare no rambling sentences inside it. So if you
are read this hurriedly you can have whole facts in it. Doesn't mean it only provides straight forward
sentences but tough core information with wonderful delivering sentences. Having Take Me (I'm Yours) in
your hand like keeping the world in your arm, facts in it is not ridiculous 1. We can say that no guide that
offer you world within ten or fifteen moment right but this guide already do that. So , this is certainly good
reading book. Hi Mr. and Mrs. active do you still doubt this?

James Williams:

Guide is one of source of information. We can add our expertise from it. Not only for students but also native
or citizen want book to know the change information of year to help year. As we know those books have
many advantages. Beside all of us add our knowledge, may also bring us to around the world. By the book
Take Me (I'm Yours) we can get more advantage. Don't that you be creative people? Being creative person
must like to read a book. Only choose the best book that acceptable with your aim. Don't always be doubt to
change your life by this book Take Me (I'm Yours). You can more appealing than now.
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