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"The Sorcerer's Apprentice" might conjure up images of Mickey Mouse from the Disney film Fantasia, or of
Harry Potter. As this anthology reveals, however, "sorcerer's apprentice" tales—in which a young person
rebels against, or complies with, an authority who holds the keys to magical powers—have been told through
the centuries, in many languages and cultures, from classical times to today. This unique and beautifully
illustrated book brings together more than fifty sorcerer's apprentice stories by a plethora of writers,
including Ovid, Sir Walter Scott, and the Brothers Grimm. From Goethe's "The Pupil in Magic" to A. K.
Ramanujan's "The Guru and His Disciple," this expansive collection presents variations of a classic passed
down through countries and eras.

Readers enter worlds where household objects are brought to life and shape-shifting occurs from human to
animal and back again. We meet two types of apprentice: "The Humiliated Apprentice," a foolish bumbler
who wields magic ineffectively and promotes obedience to authority; and "The Rebellious Apprentice" who,
through ambition and transformative skills, promotes empowerment and self-awareness. In an extensive
introduction, esteemed fairy-tale scholar Jack Zipes discusses the significance and meaning of the apprentice
stories, the contradictions in popular retellings, and the importance of magic as a tool of resistance against
figures who abuse their authority. Twenty specially commissioned black-and-white illustrations by noted
artist Natalie Frank bring the stories to visual life.

The Sorcerer's Apprentice enlightens and entertains readers with enduring, spellbinding tales of sorcery that
have been with us through the ages.
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From reader reviews:

Olivia Cook:

Reading can called brain hangout, why? Because when you are reading a book mainly book entitled The
Sorcerer's Apprentice: An Anthology of Magical Tales your mind will drift away trough every dimension,
wandering in each aspect that maybe not known for but surely might be your mind friends. Imaging every
word written in a reserve then become one form conclusion and explanation that will maybe you never get
prior to. The The Sorcerer's Apprentice: An Anthology of Magical Tales giving you yet another experience
more than blown away your thoughts but also giving you useful information for your better life within this
era. So now let us show you the relaxing pattern this is your body and mind will be pleased when you are
finished looking at it, like winning a. Do you want to try this extraordinary investing spare time activity?

Phyllis Force:

You are able to spend your free time to study this book this e-book. This The Sorcerer's Apprentice: An
Anthology of Magical Tales is simple to bring you can read it in the recreation area, in the beach, train in
addition to soon. If you did not possess much space to bring the printed book, you can buy the particular e-
book. It is make you better to read it. You can save the actual book in your smart phone. And so there are a
lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.

Myrta Bundy:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside having friends, fun activity together with family
or just watching TV all day every day. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by reading
through a book. Ugh, ya think reading a book can really hard because you have to bring the book
everywhere? It all right you can have the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like
The Sorcerer's Apprentice: An Anthology of Magical Tales which is obtaining the e-book version. So , why
not try out this book? Let's find.

Miranda Durkee:

Don't be worry in case you are afraid that this book will filled the space in your house, you can have it in e-
book means, more simple and reachable. That The Sorcerer's Apprentice: An Anthology of Magical Tales
can give you a lot of good friends because by you taking a look at this one book you have thing that they
don't and make anyone more like an interesting person. That book can be one of a step for you to get success.
This reserve offer you information that perhaps your friend doesn't know, by knowing more than some other
make you to be great persons. So , why hesitate? We should have The Sorcerer's Apprentice: An Anthology
of Magical Tales.
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