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Dancer Janet Collins, born in New Orleans in 1917 and raised in Los Angeles, soared high over the color line
as the first African-American prima ballerina at the Metropolitan Opera. Night’s Dancer chronicles the life
of this extraordinary and elusive woman, who became a unique concert dance soloist as well as a black
trailblazer in the white world of classical ballet. During her career, Collins endured an era in which racial
bias prevailed, and subsequently prevented her from appearing in the South. Nonetheless, her brilliant
performances transformed the way black dancers were viewed in ballet. The book begins with an unfinished
memoir written by Collins in which she gives a captivating account of her childhood and young adult years,
including her rejection by the Ballet Russe de Monte Carlo. Dance scholar Yaël Tamar Lewin then picks up
the thread of Collins’s story. Drawing on extensive research and interviews with Collins and her family,
friends, and colleagues to explore Collins’s development as a dancer, choreographer, and painter, Lewin
gives us a profoundly moving portrait of an artist of indomitable spirit.
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From reader reviews:

Michelle Han:

In this 21st one hundred year, people become competitive in each and every way. By being competitive right
now, people have do something to make them survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and notice
by simply surrounding. One thing that oftentimes many people have underestimated that for a while is
reading. Yep, by reading a book your ability to survive increase then having chance to remain than other is
high. For you who want to start reading the book, we give you this particular Night's Dancer: The Life of
Janet Collins book as starter and daily reading guide. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Philip Cooper:

Do you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store? Make
an effort to pick one book that you never know the inside because don't assess book by its handle may
doesn't work here is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not as fantastic as in the
outside appear likes. Maybe you answer may be Night's Dancer: The Life of Janet Collins why because the
amazing cover that make you consider in regards to the content will not disappoint a person. The inside or
content is fantastic as the outside or maybe cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly make suggestions to
pick up this book.

Alan Trevino:

As we know that book is vital thing to add our information for everything. By a publication we can know
everything we want. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated or perhaps blank sheet. Every year was
exactly added. This e-book Night's Dancer: The Life of Janet Collins was filled about science. Spend your
extra time to add your knowledge about your scientific disciplines competence. Some people has distinct feel
when they reading a book. If you know how big advantage of a book, you can sense enjoy to read a e-book.
In the modern era like currently, many ways to get book that you wanted.

Janet Warren:

A lot of book has printed but it is different. You can get it by net on social media. You can choose the top
book for you, science, comic, novel, or whatever simply by searching from it. It is known as of book Night's
Dancer: The Life of Janet Collins. You'll be able to your knowledge by it. Without departing the printed
book, it could possibly add your knowledge and make you happier to read. It is most significant that, you
must aware about publication. It can bring you from one destination for a other place.
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