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The theory of Lie groups is a very active part of mathematics and it is the twofold aim of these notes to
provide a self-contained introduction to the subject and to make results about the structure of Lie groups and
compact groups available to a wide audience. Particular emphasis is placed upon results and techniques
which explicate the interplay between a Lie group and its Lie algebra, and, in keeping with current trends, a
coordinate-free notation is used. Much of the general theory is illustrated by examples and exercises
involving specific Lie groups.
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From reader reviews:

Robert Rios:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be change about what going on or details even
knowledge to make these keep up with the era and that is always change and advance. Some of you maybe
may update themselves by reading through books. It is a good choice for you personally but the problems
coming to anyone is you don't know what type you should start with. This Lie Groups and Compact Groups
(London Mathematical Society Lecture Note Series) is our recommendation so you keep up with the world.
Why, because this book serves what you want and wish in this era.

Kevin Hamby:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to complete! A lot of people spent their spare time with their family,
or their friends. Usually they accomplishing activity like watching television, gonna beach, or picnic inside
park. They actually doing same thing every week. Do you feel it? Do you wish to something different to fill
your own personal free time/ holiday? Can be reading a book is usually option to fill your totally free time/
holiday. The first thing you ask may be what kinds of publication that you should read. If you want to try out
look for book, may be the reserve untitled Lie Groups and Compact Groups (London Mathematical Society
Lecture Note Series) can be good book to read. May be it can be best activity to you.

Joseph Cosgrove:

The reason why? Because this Lie Groups and Compact Groups (London Mathematical Society Lecture
Note Series) is an unordinary book that the inside of the publication waiting for you to snap that but latter it
will zap you with the secret the idea inside. Reading this book close to it was fantastic author who all write
the book in such amazing way makes the content interior easier to understand, entertaining approach but still
convey the meaning completely. So , it is good for you because of not hesitating having this ever again or
you going to regret it. This excellent book will give you a lot of gains than the other book get such as help
improving your ability and your critical thinking technique. So , still want to hesitate having that book? If I
have been you I will go to the guide store hurriedly.

Lorraine Cox:

Reading a book to get new life style in this yr; every people loves to learn a book. When you examine a book
you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your knowledge, because
book has a lot of information on it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts of book that you
have read. In order to get information about your research, you can read education books, but if you act like
you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, this kind of us novel, comics, and soon. The Lie
Groups and Compact Groups (London Mathematical Society Lecture Note Series) will give you a new
experience in examining a book.
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