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When parents are asked what they want for their children, they usually answer that they want their children
to be happy. Why, then, is happiness rarely mentioned as a goal of education? This book explores what we
might teach if we were to take happiness seriously as a goal of education. It asks, first, what it means to be
happy and, second, how we can help children to understand it. It notes that we have to develop a capacity for
unhappiness and a willingness to alleviate the suffering of others to be truly happy. Criticizing our current
almost exclusive emphasis on economic well-being and pleasure, Nel Noddings discusses the contributions
of making a home, parenting, cherishing a place, the development of character, interpersonal growth, finding
work that one loves, and participating in a democratic way of life. Finally, she explores ways in which to
make schools and classrooms cheerful places. Nell Noddings is Lee L. Jacks Professor of Education,
Emerita, at Stanford University. She is past president of the Philosophy of Education Society and of the John
Dewey Society. In addition to twelve books, she is the author of more than 170 articles and chapters on
various topics ranging from the ethics of care to mathematical problem solving. Her latest books are Starting
at Home: Caring and Social Policy (University of California Press) and Educating Moral People: A Caring
Alternative to Character Education (Teachers College Press), both published in 2002.
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From reader reviews:

Phyllis Peters:

Do you have favorite book? Should you have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important
thing for us to understand everything in the world. Each e-book has different aim or perhaps goal; it means
that book has different type. Some people experience enjoy to spend their time to read a book. These are
reading whatever they take because their hobby is definitely reading a book. Think about the person who
don't like reading through a book? Sometime, person feel need book if they found difficult problem or
exercise. Well, probably you will require this Happiness and Education.

Brian Roberts:

The book Happiness and Education make one feel enjoy for your spare time. You should use to make your
capable considerably more increase. Book can to get your best friend when you getting strain or having big
problem along with your subject. If you can make reading through a book Happiness and Education being
your habit, you can get considerably more advantages, like add your own capable, increase your knowledge
about a number of or all subjects. You can know everything if you like start and read a reserve Happiness
and Education. Kinds of book are several. It means that, science e-book or encyclopedia or some others. So ,
how do you think about this guide?

Robert Holt:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the extra time or they will get
lot of stress from both way of life and work. So , when we ask do people have free time, we will say
absolutely indeed. People is human not only a robot. Then we consult again, what kind of activity do you
have when the spare time coming to a person of course your answer will certainly unlimited right. Then do
you ever try this one, reading ebooks. It can be your alternative with spending your spare time, often the
book you have read is Happiness and Education.

Louise Denison:

What is your hobby? Have you heard this question when you got pupils? We believe that that problem was
given by teacher with their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby. And you know
that little person similar to reading or as examining become their hobby. You should know that reading is
very important and also book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to increase you knowledge, except
your current teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update with regards to something by book.
Amount types of books that can you take to be your object. One of them is Happiness and Education.
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