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SUPERHERO LIKE ME: THE TRUE STORY OF CHAMPIONS WHO CHANGED THE WORLD is a
vibrant and adventurous learning experience that invites readers to explore the courageous and riveting
stories of more than 30 authentic leaders of the past and present whose contributions to the world are
captured in the form of rhyme! A dynamic array of heroes (including Ramses The Great, Frederick
Douglass, Satchel Paige, Dr. Martin Luther King and Miles Davis) are featured! With bold and electrifying
visuals, it's terrifically fun and attractive and delivers quality content for teaching history, building self-
esteem and developing leadership skills. Dr. Frederick S. Humphries, President Emeritus of both Tennessee
State and Florida A&M University, says in the foreword, "This literary work could not come at a better
time." SUPERHERO LIKE ME, along with its companion book, QUEEN LIKE ME, belongs in the libraries
of families and schools interested in creating enjoyable avenues to education, providing multicultural
exposure and nurturing successful children.
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From reader reviews:

Mary Crouch:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important act, like looking
for your favorite publication and reading a e-book. Beside you can solve your trouble; you can add your
knowledge by the book entitled SUPERHERO LIKE ME: The True Story of Champions who Changed the
World! (Education Like Me). Try to face the book SUPERHERO LIKE ME: The True Story of Champions
who Changed the World! (Education Like Me) as your pal. It means that it can to become your friend when
you feel alone and beside regarding course make you smarter than ever before. Yeah, it is very fortuned in
your case. The book makes you a lot more confidence because you can know everything by the book. So , let
me make new experience in addition to knowledge with this book.

Theodore Parish:

Playing with family within a park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with friends is thing that
usually you might have done when you have spare time, and then why you don't try issue that really opposite
from that. Just one activity that make you not sense tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you
already been ride on and with addition info. Even you love SUPERHERO LIKE ME: The True Story of
Champions who Changed the World! (Education Like Me), you may enjoy both. It is fine combination right,
you still want to miss it? What kind of hang-out type is it? Oh can happen its mind hangout people. What?
Still don't buy it, oh come on its named reading friends.

Pamela Watkins:

Beside that SUPERHERO LIKE ME: The True Story of Champions who Changed the World! (Education
Like Me) in your phone, it can give you a way to get nearer to the new knowledge or info. The information
and the knowledge you are going to got here is fresh from your oven so don't possibly be worry if you feel
like an aged people live in narrow village. It is good thing to have SUPERHERO LIKE ME: The True Story
of Champions who Changed the World! (Education Like Me) because this book offers to you readable
information. Do you occasionally have book but you would not get what it's exactly about. Oh come on, that
wil happen if you have this with your hand. The Enjoyable arrangement here cannot be questionable, such as
treasuring beautiful island. So do you still want to miss it? Find this book along with read it from today!

Willis Newby:

You can get this SUPERHERO LIKE ME: The True Story of Champions who Changed the World!
(Education Like Me) by visit the bookstore or Mall. Merely viewing or reviewing it could to be your solve
issue if you get difficulties to your knowledge. Kinds of this guide are various. Not only simply by written or
printed and also can you enjoy this book by simply e-book. In the modern era including now, you just
looking from your mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose your own ways to get
more information about your book. It is most important to arrange yourself to make your knowledge are still



revise. Let's try to choose suitable ways for you.
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