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Each volume in the Exegetical Summaries series works through the original text phrase by phrase. English
equivalents are provided for all Hebrew and Greek words, making this an excellent reference for exegetes of
all levels.

Questions that occur to exegetes as they study the text are stated and then answered by summarizing the
ways many scholars have interpreted the text. This information should help translators or students in making
their own exegetical decisions.

As a basis for discussion, a semi-literal translation of the text is given. The first question to be answered is
the meaning of key words in context. Information from standard lexicons is given and then translations of the
word are cited from a dozen major Bible versions and from commentaries that offer their own translations of
the text.

Questions about the grammar and discourse structure of the original languages are answered by summarizing
the views of many commentators. When exegetical disagreements appear in the commentaries and versions,
the various interpretations are listed.

This book is not intended to replace the commentaries that are consulted. Rather than being a stand-alone
commentary, this book summarizes many important details of exegesis that should be considered in studying
the biblical text.
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From reader reviews:

Alan Durham:

Do you have favorite book? For those who have, what is your favorite's book? Reserve is very important
thing for us to know everything in the world. Each book has different aim or goal; it means that book has
different type. Some people experience enjoy to spend their the perfect time to read a book. They are reading
whatever they take because their hobby is actually reading a book. Consider the person who don't like
studying a book? Sometime, particular person feel need book when they found difficult problem or even
exercise. Well, probably you should have this An Exegetical Summary of James, Second edition.

Norman Brown:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be revise about what going on or info even knowledge
to make all of them keep up with the era which can be always change and move ahead. Some of you maybe
can update themselves by looking at books. It is a good choice for you personally but the problems coming
to you actually is you don't know what one you should start with. This An Exegetical Summary of James,
Second edition is our recommendation so you keep up with the world. Why, as this book serves what you
want and wish in this era.

Richard Hunt:

Do you one among people who can't read gratifying if the sentence chained inside straightway, hold on guys
this specific aren't like that. This An Exegetical Summary of James, Second edition book is readable by you
who hate those perfect word style. You will find the information here are arrange for enjoyable studying
experience without leaving even decrease the knowledge that want to deliver to you. The writer involving An
Exegetical Summary of James, Second edition content conveys thinking easily to understand by many
people. The printed and e-book are not different in the written content but it just different as it. So , do you
continue to thinking An Exegetical Summary of James, Second edition is not loveable to be your top
checklist reading book?

Ruth Morefield:

Playing with family within a park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with good friends is thing
that usually you will have done when you have spare time, and then why you don't try point that really
opposite from that. 1 activity that make you not experiencing tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you are ride on and with addition of knowledge. Even you love An Exegetical Summary of James,
Second edition, you could enjoy both. It is fine combination right, you still want to miss it? What kind of
hangout type is it? Oh can occur its mind hangout men. What? Still don't obtain it, oh come on its referred to
as reading friends.
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