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Grow with the Bible VeggieTales-style! Join Bob, Larry, and all the rest of the VeggieTales characters as
they explore the most amazing book of all time. Filled with fun features, children will learn more about God
and how he wants us to live.

Features include:
 
Veggie Stories feature 8 full-color, best-loved Bible stories as told in the VeggieTales videos, including
Dave and the Giant Pickle; Rack, Shack, and Benny; and Esther, the Girl Who Became Queen.
 
Book introductions give important information about each book of the Bible.
 
“Veggie Values” teach lessons from the Bible like God made you special, God loves you very much, don’t
be afraid, be kind to others, forgive one another, and many more.
 
“Remember This” highlights key verses of Scripture to remember.
 
A dictionary helps kids better understand key Bible words and concepts.

This Bible contains the complete text of the New International Reader's Version (NIrV). Written at a third-
grade level and specifically designed to help early readers discover the Bible for themselves, it's the perfect
steppingstone to the NIV.
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From reader reviews:

Willie Kelly:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important act, like looking
for your favorite book and reading a reserve. Beside you can solve your condition; you can add your
knowledge by the e-book entitled NIrV, The VeggieTales Bible, Imitation Leather, Green/Red (Big Idea
Books). Try to face the book NIrV, The VeggieTales Bible, Imitation Leather, Green/Red (Big Idea Books)
as your pal. It means that it can being your friend when you truly feel alone and beside that course make you
smarter than ever. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you. The book makes you a lot more confidence because you
can know everything by the book. So , let's make new experience and knowledge with this book.

Theresa Braun:

This NIrV, The VeggieTales Bible, Imitation Leather, Green/Red (Big Idea Books) are usually reliable for
you who want to certainly be a successful person, why. The main reason of this NIrV, The VeggieTales
Bible, Imitation Leather, Green/Red (Big Idea Books) can be one of many great books you must have is
actually giving you more than just simple reading food but feed you actually with information that probably
will shock your before knowledge. This book will be handy, you can bring it everywhere and whenever your
conditions throughout the e-book and printed people. Beside that this NIrV, The VeggieTales Bible,
Imitation Leather, Green/Red (Big Idea Books) giving you an enormous of experience for example rich
vocabulary, giving you test of critical thinking that we all know it useful in your day task. So , let's have it
appreciate reading.

Michael Kenney:

The book untitled NIrV, The VeggieTales Bible, Imitation Leather, Green/Red (Big Idea Books) contain a
lot of information on this. The writer explains the woman idea with easy technique. The language is very
clear and understandable all the people, so do not really worry, you can easy to read the item. The book was
compiled by famous author. The author will take you in the new period of time of literary works. It is
possible to read this book because you can continue reading your smart phone, or device, so you can read the
book throughout anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can available their official web-
site and order it. Have a nice study.

Cheri Adamo:

A lot of book has printed but it differs. You can get it by world wide web on social media. You can choose
the most beneficial book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever through searching from it. It is known
as of book NIrV, The VeggieTales Bible, Imitation Leather, Green/Red (Big Idea Books). Contain your
knowledge by it. Without departing the printed book, it could add your knowledge and make a person
happier to read. It is most important that, you must aware about guide. It can bring you from one location to
other place.
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